
SPANISH DICTIONARY
 

Danilo Enrique Noreña Benítez

Dictionary of meanings generated by amp.wordmeaning.org



INTRODUCTION

amp.wordmeaning.org is an open and collaborative dictionary project that, apart from being able to consult meanings of
words, also offers its users the possibility of including new words or nuancing the meaning of existing words in it. As is
understandable, this project would be impossible to carry out without the esteemed collaboration of the people who
follow us around the world. This e-Book, therefore, was born with the intention of paying a small tribute to all our
collaborators.
Danilo Enrique Noreña Benítez has contributed to the dictionary with 35388 meanings that we have approved and
collected in this small book. We hope that the reader is very valuable and if you find it useful or want to be part of the
project, do not hesitate to visit our website, we will be delighted to receive you. 
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prontitud ligereza
They are synonymous with agility, speed, speed.

prontuarial
It means a record or a court record. 

prontuario
List of offences charged to an offender .  Compendium of the Rules of a Science or Art.  Summary or list of various
things in order to keep them in mind when required.  Reminder. 

proñinez
It means for the benefit of children, for the benefit of children.  Campaigns or programs that tend to improve the quality
of life of children from birth to adolescence.  For the benefit of early childhood.

propaga
It is an inflection of spread or metastasize.  It means report, advise, publish, announce, proclaim, spread, disperse,
reproduce, spread, undermine, multiply, proliferate, expand, spread, spread.

propasarse
It means go beyond a limit, exceed what is permitted.  Abuse, overreach, exceed.

propágulo
It is a vegetative part of a plant that can be cut or separated and then grow independently.  They can be of various
kinds: tubers, rhizomes, stolons, or bulbs.  They can also be considered as propagules, buds and seeds.

propender
It means to lean or have a tendency towards something.  Procure. 

propiedades
It means that goods on which you have full control.  Possessions, belongings, property, farms, buildings.  It can also
mean characteristics, qualities, characteristics, attributes and traits.

propinado
It is an inflection of propinar. Means several things: give to drink. Abuse, hit another, deliver a coup. Supply to another a
medicine or a drench.

propositividad
A quality initiatives and positive person, but that does not speak without having previously thought thoroughly.

proptosis
In Medicna is one of the ways to call The Exophthalmia or Orbital Metastasis.  Also ophthalmic protrusion or eyeball.  It
is essentially the exit of the eyeball from the eye sockets.



propugna
Inflection of advocate. It means supporting or defending a position or idea that we consider suitable or successful.
Protect, shelter, instigate, agitate.

prorrogado
It means that a cycle of time, or term was lengthened or prolonged, prior agreement of the parties. Dilate, postpone or
delay a fact.

prorrumpia
prorrumpia is incorrectly written and it should be written as "Pardonable." being its meaning:<br>It is an inflection of
shout. It means get abruptly, suddenly, without wait it, surprise. Break, surprise.

prosa
A set of written literary works.  Natural way to express ourselves well either written or oral, but that not this subject nor to
measures or rhymes.

prosapia
Aristocratic origin or ancestry of a person.  It means lineage, ancestry, lineage, caste, class, lineage, origin, race, roots
and blood.

prosbiterio
The correct term is presbytery.  Set of Priests that belongs to the same Diocese and are under the command of the
same Bishop.  In Latin it means Council of Elders and in Greek Dean or the oldest.  In Architecture is the space that
precedes the High Altar in a church.  In the Catholic Church, it is one of the levels in the ordination of a priest
(priesthood, episcopate and presbyterate) and empowers him to impart the sacraments except for the confirmation that
is the power of the Bishop.  In the evangelical church is a group of churches of a certain geographical region.  Council of
Pastors or Evangelical Ministers of an area.

proscenio
In the old theater it was the part that was located between the stage and the orchestra.  In the theater the part of the
stage close to the public. 

proscratinacion
It is the action or effect of postpone, postpone or defer a work.  Postponement, postponement.

proscrito
You mean expelled, expatriate, exiled, uprooted, displaced.

proselitismo
It means eagerness to convince followers, followers, henchmen, addicts, supporters, fanatics.  Actions that aim to catch
followers through conviction.  

proselito
The correct term is proselyte.  It means follower, adept, henchman, addict, advocate, fanatic.



prosélito
It means follower, adept, henchman, addict, supporter, fanatic.  A person who joins a group, especially if he is religious.

prosimios
It is a suborder of primates that are characterized by prominent snouts and long tails.  In some species the eyes are side
available.  The name is technically Prosimian.  To this suborder are lemurs.

prosocial
In Colombia it was an official entity that disappeared.  Her full name was Social Holiday Promoter and she was in charge
of promoting tourism, recreation and vacations for public officials and official employees; it had a good network of
Vacation Centers distributed throughout the country.  Its ultimate purpose was to foster the employee's family unity. 
Unfortunately, due to bad management, it disappeared and many of those excellent facilities are now deteriorated and
abandoned.  There were good facilities in Bogotá, Cartagena (Hotel India Catalina), La Dorada, Fusagasugá (Los
Guaduales in Chinauta), Puente Nacional, among others.  In Psychology it is the type of behavior that benefits others or
that has positive social consequences. 

prospecciones
It is a set of methods and techniques used to find valuable or useful minerals, hydrocarbons or water deposits. The
seismic survey is one of these methods, which are sought especially hydrocarbons, making exploit sismigel in the
subsoil and Geophones are taken records of the mini-temblores than to be analyzed inform us whether or not there is
what we seek. In Cuba, prospecting refers a general recognition of the patient to detect possible diseases either latent
or incipient. Scanning.

prosperidades
It means booms, booms, progress, developments and fortunes.  It is the plural of prosperity.

prospeterito
The correct term is past post or pospreterito.  It is a conditional time of conjugation and may also indicate courtesy. 
Example: If I had enough money I would travel to Qatar World Cup.

prostibulo
brothel is incorrectly written and should be written as "40 brothel; with tilde )" being its meaning:<br>The correct term is
brothel ( with tilde ).  It is the same to that House appointments, puteadero, brothels, lupanar, brothel.

prostituirse
You want to say in general terms to engage in prostitution.  In Colombia has become synonymous with deteriorate,
degenerate, corrupted, damaged, losing moral values, losing quality, losing decency.

prostituta
Woman of the street, woman who trades in his body.  Bitch, meretriz, harlot, fufurufa and grisaux.

prostíbulo
It is the same to that House appointments, puteadero, brothels, lupanar, brothel.

prostíbulos



Place where prostitutes work.  Brothels, dating houses.

prostraron
It is an inflection of prostrar or prostrate.  It means kneel, kneel, do come.

proteasa
In biology it is a type of enzyme that breaks the bonds of proteins.  It facilitates the degradation, absorption and
metabolism of proteins.  They can also be called peptidases. 

protectiva
It means regarding protection, which provides protection.  That aims to protect.  Protective. 

protectivo
It means that it gives or provides protection, which protects.  Guard. 

protectores
Protector plural .  It means it protects or protects.  It serves as a shield or defense or give shelter and shelter.  It can also
mean that it sponsors, sponsors or sponsors.  They are also hygienic products for daily use for women and men.

protegerse
It means seeking protection or shelter.  Castling, beware, invoke, Harbor is, safeguarded.

proteína
In Physiology it is the name of a molecule composed of amino acids that is indispensable for the body to function
properly.  It is essential in body structures such as skin and hair or substances such as enzymes, cytokines and
antibodies. 

protervia
It means perversion, corruption, evil, vileness, lowliness, infamy, malignancy.  Obstinacy in doing wrong, perversity. 

protervo
It means that he maintains his attitude despite knowing that he is wrong.  Stubborn, obstinate, contumacious, porfiado,
insistent. 

protervos
Plural of wicked.  A person who is stubbornly do evil to others.  Wicked, wicked.

protestante
It means complaining, complaining, not accepting all rules or dogmas, protesting or opposing.  That censors, rejects,
rebels or claims.  In Religion, which practices prtestantism that is, they accept the Reformation of the sixteenth century
and that departed from the Catholic Church. 

proto



As a Greek source prefix, it means the primary, the first, the model, the original.  It is also a male name, of Latin origin. 
Name of a saint of the Catholic church of Italian origin.  It is also known as Proto of Aquileia. 

protogeneia
It is a word of Greek origin meaning "first birth".  In Greek mythology, the name of the sister of Epicasta, daughter of
King Calydon and Aeolia.  Protogeneia with Ares, were the parents of Oxylus of Aetolia.  Also name of an asteroid ( 147
) . 

protonefridial
It is the excretory apparatus of the invertebrate animals. They are like filters and make the function of the kidneys in
vertebrates.

protozoarios
They are unicellular, microscopic organisms of the Kingdom Protista (Protoctista) live in humid environments and some
may be parasites.

protrusion
The indicated term is protrusion, always with tilde.  It's a medical term.  In Medicine is the displacement of a part of the
body or an organ forward.  It can also be called protrusion or hernia.  It can occur in many parts of the body. 

protrusión
In Medicine is the displacement of a part of the body or an organ forward.  It can also be called protrusion or hernia.  It
can occur in many parts of the body. 

proturca
Who is an advocate or favors Turkey.  Who seeks the benefit of Turkey.  It attacks enemies of Turkey like Armenia and
Azerbaijan. 

protuyan
It is an inflection of Protuir.  You mean emigrate, move, move, move, move, out, nurture.  It comes from the Latin word
Protudere which means to move forward.

proverbiales
It is the plural of proverbial.  Relative to the proverb.  Known as always.  It means known, known and recognized,
well-known, traditional, customary.

proverbios
Proverbs is the name of one of the Books of the Holy Bible.  It belongs to the Old Testament and the Poetic Books
group.  Maximum, statements or sentences of religious or moral origin.  They are usually very old and very popular
knowledge.

providad
The correct term is honesty.  It is a personal quality that manifests itself in integrity, honesty and morality in action. 
Quality of the probo.  righteousness.



provinciano
It can mean unrefined, rude, not from a big city or capital.  That it originates from a province.  By extension any person
who is originally from outside the capital.  It is considered synonymous with naïve, unwary, candid, candorous, innocent,
gullible, confident. 

provizar
provizar is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Provisar." being its meaning:<br>The right thing is provisar.  It
means supply, provide, supply, supply, equip, dispense, give, deliver.  Anticipate, prepare.

provocador
It means that it causes provocation, that it awakens desires.  Also that incites the fight.  Quarrelsome, bully, aggressive,
inciter, instigator, agitator, troublemaker. 

provolone
It is an Italian cheese with denomination of origin, It is made with cow's milk and is native to the south of the country.

proxemia
It means degree of proximity or approach.  Difference or distance between the different spaces (intimate, personal,
social and public). 

proxeneta
Person who exploits women by inducing them to prostitution and benefiting economically from this.  A person who
commits the crime of trafficking in women (improperly called white slavery).  Pimp, Pimp, bastard, macro, pimp.

proximidades
It means close, surrounding.  In Colombia we also say "in the leaks".  Neighborhoods, adjoining areas, borders.

proxy
It means representative.  Agent, substitute or powerofent .  Person authorized to act on behalf of another .  Authorized,
proxy.

prócer
Person of very high dignity.  Eminent, illustrious, very distinguished character.  Illustrious character highly respected for
his qualities and works, and that make him worthy of all consideration.  Egregious. 

pródigo
It means wasteful.  He doesn't take care of their property and they waste them.  Wasteful, wasteful, boot.

prófugo
Person fugitive, fleeing justice.  Absent defendant.  Evaded, escaped, fugitive, deserter and defector.

prórroga
It is the extension agreed between the parts of a business or event, in a space of time.  Extension, addition,
continuation, extension, overtime, expansion, expansion.   Additional time in the sport that is played with the intention of



deciding between the result.  Additional time a term fulfilled.

próximos
You want to say the following, also the closest.  Contiguous neighbors, immediate, adjacent, border, adjacent,
bordering.

prroflauta
The correct term is perroflauta.  It is a derogatory way of referring to a young, thin and scruffy.  Careless.  Street
character who plays flute and carries a dog.

prudencia
Woman's name.  Quality of the prudent.  Common sense, judgment, caution, moderation, equilibrium.

prudentia
It is equivalent in Spanish to Prudence.  It is a woman's name and also the name of one of the cardinal virtues in Latin. 
Name of an asteroid 474 . 

pruina
It is a whitish powder or natural wax that covers some fruits, such as grapes or plums.  It can also be found on the
surface of the stems, leaves, and shoots of many plants. 

pruinoso
It is a term used in Botany.  It means coated with pruning or an epicuticular wax (outside the cuticle, which covers the
cuticle).  It's coated with a natural wax. 

pruína
In Botany it is the name given to an epicuticular wax of some fruits.  Natural wax that coats some fruits such as grapes. 

prurito
In Medicine it is the same as scratching, stinging, itching, itching, tingling.  Intense desire to scratch.  It can also be an
intense desire to make everything perfect.  Trend to perfection.

pry
It is a word in the English language that means lever (e).  Also as a verb is leverage, meddle, rubberneck, browse,
smell.

psalidoprocne
It means like a nightingale scissors.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family swallows or birds ( Hirundinidae ). 
They are found only in Sub-Saharan Africa and comprise 5 species.

psarocolius
It means starling crow, black curved magpie.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family Icteridae.  We know them
as chieftains, oropendolas or conotos.



psellioforus
It means she wears a necklace, a necklace holder, collar.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family Passerellidae. 
It is found only in Panama and the Darien area of Colombia.  There are two species.  They are known as cerqueros or
cerqueritos.

psephotellus
It means hooded parakeet or capirotado parakeet.  It is a genus of birds in the family Psittaculidae.  They are only found
north of Asutralia and are known as hooded Australian parakeets.  Only 3 species remain.

pseudastur
It means fake falcon, which looks like a falcon, similar to a falcon.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family
Accipitridae.  There are only 3 species.  They are known as hake, busardos or hawks.  They are found from Mexico to
Peru.

pseudeos
It means fake, it simulates, it looks (parrot) .  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Psittaculidae. 
They are known as loris.  There are only two species.  the shadowy lorikan, scientifically named Pseudeos fuscata,
which lives in some New Guinean mangroves and the cardinal lorikan or Pseudeos cardinalis, which remains only in the
Solomon Islands and Bismark.

pseudibis
It means false ibis , similar or similar to an ibis.  It is the name of a genus of birds, which belongs to the family
Threskiornithinae.  There are only 3 species and they are found only in Southeast Asia.

pseudoalcippe
It means false alcipe (or Alcippe), false fulveta.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Sylviidae. 
They are concoded as late, timalí Abisinio and timalí Ruwenzori.  They are found only in sub-Saharan Africa, in the
mountainous parts.

pseudoaristocrático
It means that it pretends to be aristocratic, that it simulates or appears to be.  In Colombia we call these kinds of
characters raised.  Snob.

pseudociencia
They are not science, they resemble or resemble a science without being.  It has no scientific rigor.

pseudocientífico
That it appears to be scientific , that it appears to be scientific , but it is not .  Concerning pseudoscience .  That it is
incompatible with science or the scientific method . 

pseudoleistes
It means it looks like a lark.  Fake Lark.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Icteridae.  We know
them by the yellow breast names, canaries of the mountains or tordos gu'rirahuró.

pseudonigrita



It looks like a bold, false bold (from the bird family Estrildidae).  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family
Passeridae.  They were previously listed in the ploceidae family ( weavers )

pseudopodia
It means it looks or is similar to a leg or a foot.  False paw.  In Biology it is a temporary arm-shaped projection of a
eukaryotic cell membrane, which usually goes forward to where it moves or where the food is.  Mechanism of the
psudopods for their motility and feeding.  Filaments found in the ameads.

pseudorectes
It means it looks like a whistler, similar to the cockohuí, which is like the whistler.  Fake cockohuí.  Pseudo is like, similar
and Rectes is one of the synonyms of Pitohui, which is the name of a genus of birds of the family Oriolidae. 
Pseudorectes is the name of a genus of birds that belongs to the family Pachycephalidae .  They are only found in New
Guinea.

pseudoseisura
It means fake washerwoman, fake biker.  It looks like a washerwoman.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to
the family Furnariidae.  They are known as bakers, bakers, cacholotes or homemades.

pseudotriccus
It means he looks like a flytrap.  False flytrap.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family Tyrannidae.  We know
them as tyrants, pygmy flycatchers, small tyrants or dwarf flycatchers.

pseudo}
The Greek prefix Pseudo means false or apparent.

pseudónimo
It means false name.  A fictitious name that is used to hide the true identity. 

psi
It is a unit of pressure measurement in English, which translates pounds per square inch. 

psicoafectiva
It means that they are related to the emotional, motivational and attitudinal aspects of a person. 

psicohipnoterapeuta
It is a psychologist or a psychiatrist who uses hypnosis to make therapies.

psicolabis
It can mean drink aperitif.  Also snack or very light meal.  Snack, snack.

psicología
Etymologically it's the science of the mind.  It is the branch of science that is dedicated to the study of the mind, mental
processes and behavior related to its physical and social environment.



psicorrea
It's a way to call physical and verbal violence to try to correct.  It is a term that seeks to endorse that "the letter with
blood enters" so that it can only be corrected by physical punishment.  Pseudonym of psychiatrist Angel Correa. 

psicosear
It is to make people believe something that is not true with tricks or real to another person.  In Colombia means
sugestionar, convince, suggest, influence, inspire, master, make believe, fascinate, hypnotize, bewitch, go, stop
dragging, blinded, hallucinate is, obcecar is.

psicosis
Fear, anguish, irrational obsession.  It is a mental illness that is characterized by personality alteration and is
accompanied by a severe disorder of the sense of reality.  Name of a 1960 horror film. 

psicovoro
Psicovoro/SoundCloud is a platform or application of audio that lets you hear what you like music and share the sounds
you create. It is an application for mobile phones and tablets. On the other hand, Sycamore is a fruit tree native to Egypt.
A kind of fruit.

psicógeno
It means that it occurs in the mind or thought (psyche, soul).  Psychogenic . 

psicólogo
Person who has studied Psychology.  Professional who has the ability to know the mentality, character and intimacy of
people.  Who understands the way of thinking of others. 

psilocibinas
They are hallucinogenic substances that are obtained from mushrooms of the genus Psilocybe.  They contain a potent
alkaloid. 

psilopogon
It means bearded, he has a beard.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Megalaimidae.  They are
known as bearded.  It is found in Indonesia and Malaysia.  They were previously classified in the genus Megalamia.

psitaciformes
It is the castilianization of the word Psittaciformes.  Meaning that they have form of parrots, which resemble parrots
(Greek Psittakos's parrot).  It is the name of an order of birds typical shaped by parrots, macaws and cockatoos.  This
order is subdivided into three superfamilies: Psittacoidea (typical or parrots parrots), Cacatuoidea (cockatoos) and
Strigopoidea (New Zealand parrots).

psittacara
It means with parrot face or face (or parrot).  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Psittacidae.  They
are commonly called parrots, parrots.  They are also called calancates.

psittacella
It means parrot of stripes or lists, striped parrot.  They are also called tiger parrots.  It is the name of a genus of birds



belonging to the family Psittaculidae.  They are only found in New Guinea.

psittacula
It means parrot, little parrot.  Diminutive of Psittacus ( parrot).  It is the name of a genus of parrots or parrots belonging
to the family Psittaculidae .  They are only found in Africa and some islands of the Indian Ocean.

psittaculirostris
It means gray-billed parrot.  It is a genus of birds in the family Psittaculidae.  they are only found in New Guinea.

psitteuteles
They are a variety of parrots that eat nectar and soft fruits.  They have specialized tongue in brush shape.  They are
known as loris.  They are only found in Australasia.

psittiparus
It means parrot beak.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family Sylviidae, they are called piquiloros and only live in
Southeast Asia.

psl
It is possible to ask for (PSL) psl or psi (PSI).  In both cases are acronyms.  PSL is a Colombian company of
development of Enterprise Software with Software tailored to the needs of each client.  It has headquarters in Bogota. 
PSI is the abbreviation for "pounds-force per square inch" which means pounds of force per square inch, which is a
measure of pressure.

psophodes
It means loud, bullying, rumoured.  It makes noise.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family
Psophodidae.  They are native to Australia and New Guinea.

psyche
It can also be called Psyche.  Personification of the soul .  It is the name of the allegorical goddess of the Greeks and
Romans.  Life force of the individual, human soul.  Name of an asteroid .  Sique , psyche , mind .  Set of conscious
processes of the human mind.  Wife of Eros and mother of Hedoné (Pleasure) in Greek mythology.  For the Romans this
same couple (Cupid and Psyche) were the parents of Voluptas. 

pternistis
It means sneezing, stimulating or encouraging.  .  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Phasianidae. 
They are known as Francolines.

pterocles
It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Pteroclidae.  It means that it has a bolt or key in the wings
(pointed wings).  With a hook on the wings.  They are known as ortegas or bargains.

ptilinopus
It means with pen on the foot or pen on the paw.  It is the name of a genus of birds in the family Columbidae ( pigeons). 
They are a variety of frugivorous pigeons of very colorful colors, They are found in Southeast Asia and Oceania.  They're
called lindos or tinolos.



ptilocichla
It is a genus of birds in the family Pellorneidae.  They are known as ratines.  Etymologically means with pen on the
crown, or with cup. 

ptilogonys
It means feather on the knee.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Ptilogonatidae .  They are native
to Central America and are coniosed with the names of capulineros or silky fly fly flys. 

ptilopachus
It means thick oluma.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Odontophoridae .  They are known as
colines, cdornices of the new world or corcovados. 

ptiloris
It means bird with feather on the nose.  They are known as birds of paradise and belong to the family Paradisaeidae. 
They live in Australia and New Guinea. 

ptilotula
It means with a plume of feathers on the tail.  It is the name of a genus of birds, which belongs to the family
Meliphagidae.  They are known as honeyeaders and are found in Oceania. 

ptolomeo
Ptolemy is incorrectly written and should be written as "Ptolemy ( is 41 name;." being its meaning:<br>The correct term
is Ptolemy ( 41 own name;.  Ptolemy or best Claudio Ptolomeo was a great scientist of antiquity, greco-egipcio.  He
devoted himself to astronomy, astrology, chemistry, mathematics and geography.

ptosis palpebral
In Ophthalmology is the technical or medical term for referring the eyelid or drooping eyelids.  It is due to the weakening
of the muscle that controls the eyelid, usually caused by old age. 

pua
PUA is incorrectly written and it should be written as "Spike" being its meaning:<br>The correct term is pua.  It is a
synonym of punch, needle, Stinger, Thorn, skewer, peak, puya, chuzo, hook, affliction, Peña, suffering, pain, gall,
cunning, taimado, ladino, RAM, nail, claw.  Tip or protection of the Hedgehog.

puado
It means he's got spikes or thorns.  Set of spikes that form a comb.  It is also a surname of Spanish origin.  Last name of
a Spanish footballer named javier Puado Díaz.  He plays as a striker for Españyol. 

puaya
It is the name of a village in Indonesia, which belongs to the District of Sukawati, Gianyar Regency, on the island and
province of Bali.  It is also a surname of African origin.  In Colombia puaya, means there, beyond far, far away.

pubalgia
It is a type of injury that is characterized by a great pain in the pubis.  Pain and inflammation in the pelvis and especially
in the pubis. 



puberto
It means juvenile, adolescent, individual who is in puberty (stage of physical changes).

pubertos
It refers to individuals who are in the age of puberty or adolescence. Púberes. This is the stage of development in which
the maturation of the sexual organs in both sexes are reached and its manifestations are evident with the appearance of
breasts, ovulation and menstruation in girls; changes in voice, appearance of hairs and generation of seminal fluid in
males.

pubescencias
In Botany it means hairs or hairs covering some plants (in leaves or stems).  Plural pubescence .  It is another way to
call the stage of sexual development of human beings or adolescence (puberty).

puc paak
It can mean in the mixtec language hill or heap of nopal .  In Mexico is the name of a sweet made with pumpkin seeds.

pucara
The correct term is Pucara.  It is the name of a district of the province Lampa, Puno, in the Peru.  A set of platforms,
channels, enclosures and built structures and strengths.  Aircraft built in Argentina and used in Colombia ( antiguerrillas
IA-58 41. The term in quechua language is Pukara, which means, atalaya, mirador, otero, fortress, fortification. Chieftain
name in the legend of the Laguna de La Cocha in the Department of Nariño, Colombia.

pucaxé
It is the name of a typical Mexican dish prepared with beef, pork or goat guts.  In Colombia we also call it chanfaina. 
They are also called puxaxe or putzaxe.

pucelano
It is a colloquial way of calling people born or natives of Valladolid, in Spain.  Vallisolethane, pinciano (deprecated). 
Relative to the city of Valladolid in Spain.

pucha
In Colombia and especially in Antioquia is a large, Cup double.  It is also in that same container a measure for grains. 
Bowl, tazota.  It amounts almost to two-liter.

puche
In Colombia it is a costeño surname.  It's a slash or poaching inflection.  It can mean pushing, animating, aupar, but it is
most used in the Tolima to indicate that the containor is inadvertently given an advantage.  Facilitate, help, give
advantage.  Give others a chance to profit from our naivety.  Give papaya ( or be left paying )

puchecas
In Colombia is a colloquial way of referring to a woman's breast.  It is considered a word subtle and not offensive. 
Breasts, breasts,

puchero
In Colombia is a typical dish, especially the Department of Boyaca, which has many tubers and vegetables.  Cooked, I



stew.  It also tells you stew to a cooking vessel used to cook food, pot, crock pot.  Stew is also a gesture that makes a
child, showing displeasure with the mouth.  Mohin, WinCE, gesture.  Nickname of an Argentine second.  called José
Varacka.

puchi
Puchi is a surname that is used in several South American countries. It exists in Chile, Venezuela and Colombia. There
is also the surname Puche.En quechua language means subtract, remove, diminish.

puchica
Puchica expressions, Juepuchica, Juepucha, juepuerca, hijuepuchica, hijuepuerca or hijuepucha are expressions used
in Colombia, does not really mean anything and always expressed surprise, admiration, anger or shock. It is clarified
that none of the expressions is considered a swear word, not an offence for someone.

puchis
It is an expression of Maya origin, widely used in Central America and denotes surprise, amazement or anger. 

puchito
It is a diminutive of pucho.  In Colombia is a colloquial form of call cigarette, even more so when is about to be
consumed.  It is also used as a synonym for little, little, indicating scant amount, how many grains, fewer.  It is a word of
quechua origin, indicating a small quantity (puchu).  Tailpiece.

pucho
In Colombia is a colloquial form of call cigarette, even more so when is about to be consumed.  It is also used as a
synonym for little, indicating scant amount, how many grains, little less.  It is a word of quechua origin, indicating a small
quantity (puchu).  Tailpiece.

puchunga
Mean heart ( but not referring organ or viscera but affectionate Word ) affection, love.  Puchunguero is loving. 
affectionate, tender.  Puchunga, puchungo, puchunguita is the person who arouses us feelings of love, affection,
tenderness and affection.  Person who robs us the heart, the person loved.  The word is of quechua origin.

puchunguito
Puchunguita or puchunguito means sweetie, sweetheart, love.  Diminutive puchungo or puchunga .  It is referred to the
person who generates love, affection or tenderness.  It generates a lot of affection. 

pucritud
The correct word is neatness.  It is the quality of clean.  It means that it is clean, neat, care, hygiene, impeccable.

pud
It means loose, weak, useless.  Young people also use it to mention the male member, penis, Dick.

pudinga
In Geology is a type of sedimentary rock.  Conglomerate of boulders.  Very hard and wear-resistant rock.  It is often
used as grinding stone.



puebla
It is an inflection of populate.  It means reside, dwell.  It is the name of a city and a State in Mexico.  The city of Puebla
Mexican soccer team.  .

pueblecito
Diminutive of village.  Small town, small town.  Village, hamlet .  Populated by few houses and few inhabitants. 

pueblito
Affectionate way used by every Colombian to call his hometown or homeland girl.  Small town.  Diminutive of people.

puebloviejero
In Colombia is the adjective of the born, related or residing in Pueblo Viejo, Department of Magdalena municipality and
was the form of call as the former born, residents or related to the municipality of Aquitania in Boyacá Department. 
Aquitaine was previously called Pueblo Viejo. ´Pueblo viejo, Magdalena, is the island of Salamanca.

puerco
In Colombia it is a way of calling the pig, pig, pig, pig.  It means dirty, filthy, unhygienic.  No cleaning, no toilet, no
hygiene.  Uneased.

puercoespín
It is a small rodent mammal with the body covered with spines or quills.   They should not be confused with hedgehogs
(Erinaceidae family) and Echidna (Echidna family), because these are not rodents but insectivorous.  Porcupines at the
same time, belong to two different families of rodents Erethizontidae (Native American) e Hystricidae (old world natives).
 To the American porcupines also coendus, cuendus and ursones are called.

pueril
It means that it has no value or interest.  Little valuable.  Trivial, insignificant, bland, childish, trivial, futile, frivolous.  It
can also mean known, trite, ordinary, regular, vulgar.

puerquito
Diminutive pork.  Marranito, chanchito, piglet, piggy.  Pet that eats everything.  It can also mean dirty, filthy, unscrateed.

puerta
It means access, portal.  It is a work of a construction, which is movable and usually of different material (wood, iron,
plastic, acrylic) masonry.  It is a surname of Spanish origin.  Gate, gate, goal, goal, exit.

puertardo
It is a word derived from a door and corresponds to a derogatory.  They are also: portica, portezuela, small town, door,
portastro, puertuza, puertonga. 

puerteja
Derivative and derogatory door.  Fake or disguised door.  Portillo, door. 

puerto rico



Name of a free state associated with the United States.  It is an island on the Caribbean.  Name of two Colombian
municipalities that belong to the Departments of Caquetá and Meta. 

puerto vallarta
Puerto Vallarta is the name of a Mexican city and port over the Pacific Ocean.  It is located in Banderas Bay and
belongs to the State of Jalisco.  It is a famous and beautiful spa.

puertonga
It's a derogatory derivative of door.  Ugly door.  Portezuela, door, pork. 

puger
The correct term is Puger ( it is proper name ) and it's better still Pangeran Puger ( Prince 41 Puger;.  It is the name of
an Indonesian Prince who was Sultan or Susuhanu in the State of Mataram in Java between 1708 and 1719.

pugés
Last name of a Catalan independenceist.  Its full name is Pere Pugs i Dorca .  He was one of the founders of the
Catalan National Assembly.

pugilato
It means fight, confrontation, encounter, quarrel.  Fistfighting. 

pugilismo
It is the activity of boxing.  Techniques and organizational systems of the Sport of boxing or sport of boxing. 

pugilista
It means fighter, boxer, boxer.  Athlete who is dedicated to the activity of boxing. 

pugilístico
It means relative to boxing, which belongs to boxing, of the sport of flat noses.  Boxing .  relating to boxing matches. 

pugio
It was a sharp-cut weapon used by the Roman soldier of antiquity.  Dagger, dagger.   Weapon that is wielded.

pugna
Fight between several contenders to prove their superiority or leadership.  In Colombia it means struggle, war, fight,
contest, rina, combat, confrontation, lid, disputed, challenge, competition, competition.

pugnable
Said everything that can be put in doubt, in discussion or that can become peleable, drinkable or as.

pugnacidad
It means ability to fight.  Gnaz quality.  Quality of a warrior who consists of fighting relentlessly.  Persist in the fight. 
Aggressiveness, belligerence, belligerence. 



pugnan
It means that they try to achieve, achieve or obtain.  It is an inflection of pugnar.  It means compete, pretend, fight,
battle, combat, contest, challenge.

pugurificon
pugurificon is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Slums" as meaning:<br>I think that they wanted to see
tugurificacion or overcrowding. These terms refer to the proliferation of irregular housing construction and quality of
materials and structures, usually in invasions and close to cities or towns. They obviously lack of public services and
soon become public health and public order problems.

puigdemón
It's a Catalan surname.  Surname of a Catalan journalist and politician, whose full name is Carles Puigdemont i
Casamajó.  He is currently a Member of the European Parliament. 

puja
puja is incorrectly written and should be written as bid ( when it is last name ).  being its meaning:<br>It is an inflection of
bid.  Mean bid, strive, push, deliver, improve, increase, hesitation, whining.   Release plaintive sounds tired or during
childbirth.  In Colombia Puja is also a surname.  It is also the name of a village in Nepal.

pujanza
Energy, strength or vigor that you have to do something.  Power, power. 

pujllay
It is the name of a traditional Bolivian dance, from the region of Tarabuco, which is the capital of the province of
Yamparaes.

puking
It is a word of the English language that means vomiting.

pukuy
It is the name of a sad song avecita also called snipe.  It is the Thinocoridae family.  It seems one ground Dove.

pular
It is the name of a nomadic African people from the western part of the black continent.  It is also known as Fula, Peul,
Fulbe, Fulani, Fulani. 

pulaski
It is the name of a city in the State of Tennessee in the United States.  The name of a county in the State of Missouri. 
Polish surname of a soldier who fought in the American Revolution.  Last name of Polish origin that exists in the United
States.

pulcata
Place where they sell fermented medel, pulques.  Sale of pulque .  The term is used in Mexico City DF.



pulcova
It is a surname of a woman of Russian origin, named Nadia Pulcova.  Pulcovo or Pulcovo is the name of some hills in
Russia and of the main Astronomical Observatory in the South of Petersburgo.

pulenta
It means poor, poor and uneducated.  It is the opposite of opulent.  In Chile is used as a synonym for magnificent,
powerful, Supreme, great, beautiful.

pulero
pulero is incorrectly written and should be written as Pulero ( by poolero )  being its meaning:<br>It is a way of calling
the billaristas specializing in the game of billiards pool ( 41 pul.  In some parts also say pulero footballer that pretends to
fouls launched onto the floor, piscinero.

pulgar
It's the name of the big toe.  It is also called a pokery.  It is the name of one village in Germany and another in Spain
(Province of Toledo).  It is also the surname of Spanish origin.  Surname of a football player of Chilean origin and whose
full name is Erick Antonio Pulgar Farfán .  He plays for Fiorentina and is a containment flyer.

pulgo
It can mean pederast or effeminate.  It is also the charge character of clean and preparing food in a brothel.  Male flea.

pulgones
Plural of aphids.  Name given to agricultural pests that are also known as aphids.  They produce gills or cecidias in
plants, a kind of tumors.  Augmentative and plural of flea.  Big fleas.

pulguita
Flea diminutive.  Small flea.  In Colombia colloquial way of referring to something small.  Also in Colombia it is an
affectionate way of referring to the beetle or volkswagen car, also known as Beetle, Fusca or Käfer. 

pulicidos
The pulicidos have nothing to do with Diptera ( 2 wings 41 moscas-insectos;.  The pulicidos are insects of the order
Siphonapterae ( siphonaptera ) and they belong to the family Pulicidae.  They are commonly called fleas.  There are 181
species.

pulla
In Colombia to say indirectly, sarcasm, poignancy, irony, tort, DART, virulence, satire, tip, puya.

pulóver
It means diver, sweater, sack. 

pulpa
It means, referring to meat, which lacks fat, nerves or bones.  Which is lean and clean.  Referring to fruits, dough that
has no shells, impurities or seeds. 



pulpaba
It is inflection of pulp. It is a term used den dentistry and refers to treatment and care in the pulp of the tooth ( malm
called " nerve ". Pulp capping is intended to preserve the pulp and prevent irreversible injuries of the same.

pulpear
It means to take advantage of another person. It is also a benefit, have fun, exploit, abuse, rape, violating. Mostly in
Chile and Argentina is used.

pulpería
It is a type of commercial place where groceries and groceries are sold.  Grocery store.   It was also called a place
where they sold spirits and intoxicating drinks. 

pulpito sin tilde
The Colombia pulpit, without the tilde, mean no fat and no bone.  It is a diminutive of Octopus, which means the same
thing.  Lean.

pulpí
It is the name of a Spanish (Andalusian) municipality.  It is located in the Autonomous Community of Andalusia, in the
Province of Almería. 

pulpo
It is the name of an octopod mollusk that usually lives at the bottom of the sea.  Its scientific name is Octopus vulgaris
and belongs to the Octopídae family. 

pulque
It is the name of a popular intoxicating drink in Mexico.  It is obtained by fermentation of mead or maguey sap.

pulque curado
It is a variety of pulque (liquor that is prepared from maguey), mixed with fruit.  Intoxicating drink from Mexico. 

pulquérrima
It is the superlative of neat.  It means very clean, extremely neat and clean.

pulquérrimo
It means very neat, extremely neat, neat, clean, impeccable.  Very clean, very easy.

pulqui
It is a word of Mapuche origin that means felcha.  Name of a prototype aircraft designed by the Argentine Air Force.  It
was the first aircraft to be manufactured in Latin America. 

pulsante
It means that it pulsates, which emits intermittent noises or flashes, pulses or beats.  That produces flashes, vibrations
or sounds with intermittencies (that is, they are not constant but in intervals). 



pulsar
It means to hold, calculate, weigh, feel, feel.  Test, probe, examine, evaluate.  It can also mean playing, tearing,
manipulating a musical instrument.  Another meaning is to tañer, squeeze, press, press (for example a key).  Beat,
throb. 

pulsera
It is a type of ornament of any kind of material that is used on the wrist.  It can be used by anyone : male, female,
children. 

pulsetilla
pulsetilla is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Pulsatilla" being its meaning:<br>The correct term is Pulsatilla.
It is a homeopathic remedy extracted from the plant Pulasatilla vulgaris ( known as Flor de el Viento or Flor de Pascua ).
Used to counteract fevers or infections.

pulsioxímetro
In Medicine, it is an electronic device that allows to indirectly measure the degree of oxygen saturation in the blood.  It is
also called a pulse oximeter.

pulso
Correction of the watches used on the wrist.  Bracelet, bracelet.  It can be leather or metallic.  Force play that is done on
a table between two people and supporting the elbows.  Palpitation, heartbeat, aiming, discretion.  Measurement or
comparison .  It can also mean tino, aim.

pulsos
Pulse plural .  heart palpitations.  Also in Colombia is the name of the leather or metal slides of a watch.

pulul
In Chile is the name of a river and a valley.  They are sites of unparalleled natural beauty.  They are close to Temuco.  It
means it moves or floats.

pulverizado
It means reduced to dust.  Solid body transformed into very small particles.  Crushed, ground, crushed, disintegrated,
crumbled, atomized.  It also means crushed, defeated, defeated, destroyed, overwhelmed, annihilated. 

pulverizar
Reduce a solid body to dust.  cause a solid body to transform into very small particles.  Crush, grind, crush, disintegrate,
shred, atomize.  It also means crush, defeat, defeat, destroy, overwhelm, annihilate. 

pumamaqui
pumamaqui is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Pumamaqui" being its meaning:<br>Pumamaqui is a stream
that is born in the cordillera de Los Andes, in the Canton of Cuenca, province of Azuay, in the Ecuador.

pumpa
In Venezuela it is a way of calling the top hat.  In Chile it is a way of calling the butt, buttocks or tail. 



pumpuna
It means pump, large, inflated.  It is a term used in entomology as an epithet of an insect of the family Buprestidae
(beetle or cockroach).  They are wood borers or trousers and xylophages.  The full scientific name is Chrysobothris
pumpuna.  Harmful pest of wood . 

puna
It is the name of an Ecoregion located in southern Peru and reaches as far as northern Argentina.  It is characterized by
being a plateau, with heights above 4000 meters and with vegetation of pajonales.  High Mountain Plateau.

punani
In English and vulgarly it means vagina.  The name of a song by 6ix9ine or Tekashi 6ix9ine, an American rapper.  His
real name is Daniel Hernandez- . 

punch
( Addition ) .  In Colombia Punch, it was also the name of a great television programmer.

punche
It's the same as punche or punch.  It is a Mexican sweet made with milk, blue corn, cinnamon, vanilla and sugar.  It can
also be a smoothie of eggs, sugar and liquor.

punchi
In Mexico it is a sweet made with blue corn, milk, sugar, vanilla and cinnamon.  it can also be a preparation of liquor and
beaten eggs that is also called punch or punch.

pundonor
It means decorum, dignity, honor, pride, conscience, modesty, shame.  Berraquera, bravery, gallantry.  Feeling by which
we demand from ourselves the maximum dedication and the maximum effort to obtain the achievements, without
decaying in the process. 

punga
In Chile it means crook, thief.  Person who practices tickling or stealing the pockets or wallets of victims.  The word has
Italian origin and means pocket.  Pickpocket. 

pungarabato
pungarabato is incorrectly written and should be written as "Pungarabato ( is 41 name;." being its meaning:<br>The
correct term is Pungarabato ( 41 own name;.  In language Purépecha means Hill of the plumage, Hill in the form of
feathers.  It is a municipality of Altamirano, in the State of Guerrero, Mexico.

punible
It's worth a penalty or penalty.  Which is damnable.  Which is punishable.  He deserves punishment.  Fact that is
considered a crime and is punished by law. 

punkie
Person who belongs to the punk movement or who likes that kind of music.  The word as such means garbage, scum. 
Counterculture.  It is very peculiar her clothing, makeup, tattoos and haircuts.



punta
It means end, vertex, edge, peak, Spike, Spike, Horn, antler, Python, picacho, Cape peninsula.  It can also mean
quantity, herd, heap, handful, indirect, pulla, Stinger, RAM.

punta cana
It is a very touristy urban center of the Dominican Republic.  It is located in the Province of Altagracia.  The region is
known as The Coconut Coast.  The original name of the place, Yauya or Punta Borrachos. 

puntahuasi
It means house on the summit or house on the top (house at the tip or tip of the hill).  It is the name of a Peruvian
municipality belonging to the Department of Huánuco. 

puntal
In Colombia and especially in the Coffee Region, it means light food that is taken in the afternoons.  It is usually latte or
chocolate with parva ( bread) and cheese.  It is similar to what is called elevens in Bogota (which is curiously taken in
the afternoons between 3 and 5 pm).  It is also called "the something" or "point".  The light meal in the mornings is called
nines or half nines and the evening snack.  They are very common customs among peasants and copied in the city.

puntazo
Injury or injury caused by the appearance of something.  It is the wound caused by a pointed object (skewer, spike,
stinger, chuzo, puja or needle).  Puyazo , aguijonazo , chuzón .  Injection.  It is also the blow that is given to a ball with
the pint of the foot. 

puntería
It means tino, pulse, eye, success, dexterity, security.  Ability or dexterity to aim, to hit.  Ability or dexterity to hit the
target more often.  

puntiar
In Colombia it means going first in a sports competition.  It is also hitting with the tip of the foot something.  Another
meaning is to carry the rhythm when playing or playing the guitar.  Tapping is also used. 

puntilla
In Colombia is synonymous with nail.  Diminutive of tip.  Metallic pointed element used to join pieces of wood.

puntillo
Point diminutive.  Small point.  Colloquially self-love, pundonor, calrquera. 

punto de rocio
It is the lowest degree of temperature at which water vapor begins to condense and the first drops of water are formed.  .

puntos cardinales
They are the four reference points in a Cartesian plane.  Different points of location or orientation every 90° at the
circumference.  Use is widespread around the world as well: 0° North ( 12:00 on the clock ) 90° 40 East; 03:00 ) 180°
South ( 06:00 ) and 270° West ( 09:00 ).  Another way to establish them is by placing the right hand to the East ( sunny )
, the left hand 40 West; where the Sun ) to the front is the North and South back.



puntuales
Plural of punctual .  It means they arrive on time, they are strict.  It means accurate, regular, strict, accurate, compliant. 
They exactly comply with what they are asked of or demanded.  Obedient.

puntuda
It has tip, which is pointed.  It ends in a spike or skewer at the end.

puntudo
In Colombia it means sharp, having tip.  Cocky, abusive and harassing.

punzante
It can mean biting, incisive, satirical, caustic.  That speaks with irony.  That it is pointed and that it punctures.  That
sucks, that harasses, that attacks. 

punzó
It's a puncture inflection, which means stinging, sucking.  prick.  It's also a way to call an intense red color.  derives from
the French word ponceau, which is a way to call the poppy wild and it has flowers of that color. 

punzón
In Colombia is a very resistant metal and sharp tool used to drill walls or walls.  We also call it a pointer.

puñal
Sharp weapon.  White gun.  Knife, dagger, stylus, faca.  Relative to the fist.  It is caught or grasped with your hand or
with your fist.

puñera
The Colombia means beating, fight, or blows with fists.  Rina fistfights.

puñetas
It is a lace or trim with veil in the cuffs of a shirt sleeve.  Anger, annoyance.  Bully, bully, troublemaker, conflicting.

puñete
In southern Colombia and Ecuador it means fist, punch, blow given with the hand closed or gripped.  It is also the name
given to a bracelet, slave or btazalete that is used on the wrist.

puño
Closed hand.  Blow given with a closed hand.  End and trim of the long sleeves of a shirt.  Small amount of something
that fits in the hand (handful).  Name given to the action of closing a hand (having the fingers folded against the palm
and thumb retracted). 

pupilaje
It is the same thing that I take care of or lodging.  It is the action or effect of caring for or hosting animals, especially
horses.  Have horses as pupils or in care.  Accommodation, pension, hostel.  It also means tutoring.  Care or
surveillance of cars or vehicles temporarily.



pupitrazo
It is an augmentative of desk, furniture used by students during the classes.  Once as with the desk tops to make noise
or blow given with hands over the top of the desk to approve something.  In Colombia it is said to "pass to pupitrazo", to
refer to meetings of Council, Assembly or Senate, which approves all quickly and without much details.

pupitre
It is the name of the furniture that each student uses in their school or college.  School chair . 

pupo
It is a Quechua word meaning navel.  Body center.  Scar or brand of umbilical cord .

puppet
It is an English word meaning puppet, doll, puppet. 

pupusa
It is a typical dish from El Salvador.  It consists of an Arepuela or Tortilla and is accompanied by multiple ingredients. 
There are cheese, beans, etc.  In the places where they sell them, which are very common in that country are called
Pupuseria.

pupusas
Popular name of a corn arepas filled with various ingredients that are consumed in El Salvador. 

pupusería
It is a word that is used in El Salvador, Guatemala and Honduras.  It is the place where you make or sell pupusas, which
are a kind of arepuelas or tortillas of corn or rice filled in many ways.

pupuso
In Guatemala and El Salvador, pupusa is a type of arepa, usually stuffed.   It consists of an Arepuela or Tortilla and is
accompanied by multiple ingredients.  There, they put pupuso to who is fat, obese, pot or plump.   Also to the glutton, to
which he eats a lot.

puquios
It is a quechua word meaning Springs, water births, water eyes, manas, wells. It is also a city and a district in Peru.

pure
The correct term is pure (with accent).  Pure call all solid food crushed or marinated.

purembe
Own pertaining or belonging to a native ethnic group from the Highlands of Michoacán, Querétaro and Guanajuato, in
Mexico. It also tells them tarascan or Purépecha. Language of this ethnic group.

purepecha
The correct term is Purepecha, is the name of a people and language, Mexican aborigines of the area of Michoacán. 
Also called them Michoacas or Michoacan.  In language Nahuatl, Michoacan means place or land of fishermen.



puré
It is a culinary product that results from crushing or crushing some cooked food, such as potato, banana.  Maceration of
vegetables, whether vegetables, vegetables or tubers.

purépecha
Mexican Aboriginal village, located in Michoacan.  You are also known as Tarascanos, michoacas or Michoacan.  They
are predominantly fishermen.  Their language.

purica
It is a brand of whole products, supplements, and solutions for a healthy and balanced lifestyle.

puridad
That shows or denotes purity.  It is clean, without stain, which is not contaminated, originality, authenticity, naturalness,
diaphaneity and candor.

purificación
It is the action or effect of clean, purify.  It is the name of a municipality of the Department of Tolima in Colombia.  It is
known as "La Villa de las Palmas".

purina
Name of a concentrated animal feed, widely used in poultry and fish farming.  Name of the company that produces this
concentrate.  In chemistry, it is a group of aromatic heterocyclic organic compounds.  They have a nitrogen base.  The
most important are adenine and guanine, which are chemical compounds that cells use to make the building blocks of
DNA and RNA. 

purisco
The name given to the flowers of fabaceous plants such as bean or bean.

purisil
Purisil is the name of a town in Costa Rica, in the Province of Orosi, Carthage.  It's a tourist town.

purlo
He is one of the many fictional characters in "The Legend of Zelda", a video game of Japanese origin. 

puro
It means clean, clear, limpid, net, simple.  Without impurities.  I entire, straight, virtuous.  It is also a cigar made from
rolled tobacco leaves.  Habano, veguero, tobacco.

purofloro
A way of Peruvians is denote language embellished or lengthened, verbosity, speaking generously and sometimes
without. Extensive discourse. In Colombia we say verbiage, cart, macumba, straw, chatter, talkative.

purrete
It means boy, young man, adolescent, boy, boy, boy, child who has grown up.  Young and inexperienced boy. 



purria
Despicable people, people who do not generate any affection. 

puruay
It is the name of a river in the Province of Cajamarca, in Peru.  There is also a river with the same name in Venezuela
from the slope of the Orinoco River (Santa Cruz de Cachipo, State of Anzoátegui).

purupuru
In the anime kingdom is the name of an evil fairy in Kirakira.  It is one of the common names given in Ecuador the
gulupa, a fruit of the family Pasiflorácea.  Its scientific name is Passiflora pinnatistipula (family Passifloraceae).

pururú
In Argentina it is a way of calling the crisps or popcorn.

pus
In Colombia, pus is the same as matter, yellowish or greenish and thick liquid that forms in an infected tissue.  Drain the
pustule.  Infection.

pusher
It is an English word that means supplier, driver, delivery, deliverer, pusher, passing.  In the oil industry we use the
terms "tool pusher", which is the person who passes, delivers or supplies the necessary tools in drilling a well.

pusilamime
The correct term is cowardly.  Mean weak, cowardly, loose, timid, timid, cringing, aguevado, pelele, shy, timid,
submissive.

pusilánime
You want to say timid, fearful, cowardly, loose, indecisive, pusillanimous, shy.

pusose
pusose is incorrectly written and should be written as "40 Pusose; with tilde )." being its meaning:<br>It is an inflection of
be. Means was, it was placed, it stood. Spruce is, dressing, sheathing it, placed, placed.

puspús
It is one of the common names of a shrub plant of various uses (medicinal, industrial, for firewood, dry cleaning, etc.).  It
is from the Fabaceae family and its scientific name is Zuccagnia punctata.  It is also known by the names of pus-pus,
male jar, pispito jar or can.

pusteco
In Mexico is a surname.  As a noun (in Mexico) it means desganado, no appetite, no desire to eat, with loss of appetite. 
, Listless.

pusteque
It means sad, desolate, disappointed, depressed, heartbroken.  That he is overwhelmed by sadness or disappointment. 



pusuqui
It is the name of a small Ecuadorian town in the Province of Pichincha.  Name of Barrio de Quito .  Name of the former
Hacienda Real, located in the Pomasqui Valley, in Quito (Ecuador).  This estate is part of the private patrimony of the
House of Orleans-Bourbon.  It means puma perches in Quechua and Caranqui languages.  White-haired, gray-haired,
gray-haired. 

pusuy
Colombia is one of the common names of a Palm known as mapora, ciamba, cinamillo or maquenque.  Its scientific
name is Oenocarpus mapora.  belongs to the family Arecaceae.  It is a word of the language Saliba and means Palm
(Palm thick).  It is also the alias of an offender in Colombia.

puta
Woman exercising prostitution.  Sex worker.  Harlot, meretriz, prostitute, prosti hetaira.

putasos
The correct term is (with z).  In Colombia it is commonly used and in a vulgar way, it means outrages, insults, offenses,
insults, rudeness, imprecations.

putear
In Colombia it means insulting, throwing expletives.  It can also be engaged in prostitution. 

putin
It is the surname of the current President of Russia (Vladimir Vladimirovich Putin).

putinejo
It is a term coined by Javier Rubio and that refers to a person related to imperialist and authoritarian regimes such as
that of Vladimir Putin.  A character who, protected by ideological defense, defends the invasion or does not assume a
specific position in relation to the conflict between Russia and Ukraine. 

putingui
it is a surname of Italian origin.  In the slang arrabalero means cheap prostitute, street and ordinary whore. 

puto
In Colombia means strong, brave, warrior, courageous, feisty, daring, risky, decided.  He doesn't feel fear.

putófo
It's a way of calling the one who hates prostitutes. 

putt
It's an English language term.  It is a term used in the sport of Golf.  It refers to a short or soft stroke, which is done in
the vicinity of a hole.  Hit inside a green. 

puvis
The correct term is pubis, with B.  It means an anatomical part of the body located below the belly, usually covered with



hair.  Mount Venus.  The name of a part of the hip bone (located at the front).

puxaxe
It is one of the names of a typical Mexican dish and especially Chiapas (from Chiapas).  It is prepared with meats of res
or pork in quite a very thick sauce of chilies.  It is also often called putzatzé.  It is consumed in the traditional festivities of
costumed dancers. 

puya
In Colombia it means Thorn, needle, Thorn, pua, sliver, tip, hint, claim.  It is also one of the classes of Vallenato rhythm
that exists in Colombia.  Determining pace for the election of a King Vallenato.

puyar
In Colombia it means chuzar, hurting with something very pointed.  Chop, sting.  Attack or injure with a puya or squea.

puyar el burro
it is a very colloquial expression of the Colombian Atlantic Coast and means to leave, to walk away, to evade an
embarrassing situation.  Retire.

puyazo
Wound caused by a thorn, puya, chuzo, PIN or needle.  Aguijonazo, chuzon, aguijonazo, prick.

puyeki
It is one of the common names given in Mexico to a fish.  It is also known as sleepy, puyeque, chalaco, porroco or
sleeper.  It is a coastal fish of the Pacific Ocean from California Peru.  Its scientific name is Dormitator latifrons and
belongs to the family Eleotridae.

puyón
In Colombia it also means that it has spikes, that he or that he is pointed.

puza
It is one of the common names of a mushroom or edible fungus.  Its scientific name is Armillaria mellea,
Physalacriaceae family.

puzanga
Pusanga or puzanga is an oily and aromatic oil or extract used to attract loved, prepared based on Andean and
Amazonian weeds.  It is also used as a self-esteem lifter and converter in center of attraction to all others.  It's only
enough to get a few drops on your hands or neck.  It is typical of the South American Amazon region.  In Colombia you
can assimilate with the quereme or follow me.  Generically you can call maranguango, word of origin Embera which
means witchcraft.

puzolana
Means of Puzol, Italian town near Naples, which comes from Puzol.  It is also a mineral, represented mostly by dust or
volcanic ash.  To be hydrated makes up a kind of cement.



puzun
It means stomach, belly gut.  is a word of Quechua origin. 

púa
Small, firm and slender body that ends in a funta.  Small pointed body.  Spike, thorn, stinger. 

púgil
Person who is dedicated to the sport of flat noses or boxing.  Pugilist, boxer, wrestler, gladiator.

púlpito
It is the name given to a small and high platform, which is found in churches and which is where the priest climbs to
preach. 

púlsar
In astronomy, it is the name given to a neutron star.  It emits a very intense periodic radiation but at very short and
regular intervals.  They have a very intense magnetic field. 

púsome
It is an inflection of be.  It means placed, placed, spruce is, dress up, sheathing is, deposit, get, send, add, have.

pútrido
Organic body in decomposition.  It means rotten, decomposed, rancid, rotten past, damaged.

pycnonotus
It means compact back.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Pycnonotidae.  They are known as
nightingales or bulbules.

pymecidio
It is the way to call for the elimination of small and medium-sized enterprises because of the lack of activation by the
Covid-19. 

pyrenestes
Breast red fire.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Estrildidae.  They are called piquigordos or
nutcracker finches and are from Mozambique and Tanzania.

pyrgilauda
It means white-breasted sparrow.  It is the deprecated name of a genus of birds that was attached to the family
Passeridae.  They're from central Asia.  Some authors prefer to use Montifrigilla.

pyriglena
It means cone eyes of fire (eyes red fire).  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Thamnophilidae. 
They are called fire-eyed anthills.



pyrilia
It means they have the sides or green ijares.  It is a genus of birds in the family Psittacidae.  They're called parrots or
parrots.  As there are many classes you can call them red-headed parrots.

pyrrha
Pyrrha is incorrectly written and it should be written as Pyhrra ( 41 own name;.  being its meaning:<br>The correct term
is Pyhrra ( 41 own name;.  In Greek mythology was a daughter of Epimetheus and Pandora.  It was spouse of
Deucalion, with whom he had 6 children.

pyrrhocorax
Colorful flame crow (or fire-billed crow).  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Corvidae.  They are
commonly referred to as chovas.  They are very given to parasitism in posture and breeding.

pyrrhula
Pyrrhula is more suitable.  It means with tail of red on or fire red.  It is the name of a genus of birds belonging to the
family Fringillidae.  They are known as shrimp.  They're seed birds.

pytagua
It is a term of the Guarani language.  It means strange, foreign, stranger.  On the other hand.  Gringo.

pythia
It was the name of the high priestess of Apollo at Delphi.  In Greek mythology it was known as the Oracle of Delphi. 

pytilia
Pyrilia is more suitable, although Pytilia is also valid.  It means with the side of fire red, with the colored ijares.  It is the
name of a genus of birds belonging to the family Estrildidae.  They have short beaks and bright colors.  They are known
as styldas.

q
It is the name of a music magazine Rock and Pop, which is published in the United Kingdom.  It's name is Q
(capitalized).

q es chirrete
It means gross rustic, coarse, tasteless, ordinary. In Colombia sometimes used as a synonym for chilguete, chorrion,
splatter, stain, dirt, filth.

q es un bledos
The phrase is " A 34 damn me; which in Colombia is also used as " I care a radish " and more still 34 rude; Okay egg ".
All these phrases mean that something not worth anything, that is insignificant, which is harmless.  That it does not fully
value, which does not deserve importance.   " I care a damn ". Even the smallest elements.

q significa chamom
I think they're asking for chamon.  If so, it is another of the names given to a black plumage bird.  It is also known as
black tordo, black tordo, blackberry, blackbird, common tordo, queen Josmary, chupin, mulatto, vaqueri, cowboy bird
and blackbird cowboy.  Its scientific name is Molothrus bonariensis and belongs to the family Icteridae .  It is found



almost all over America.

q significa chuchuca
It is a way of calling corn to ripen, so it is neither tender (soft or milky) nor hard io dry.  Name of a Brazilian song by Axe
Bahia.  Tchutchuca.  In Colombia Chuchupa, with p , is the name of gas wells in the Guajira and the oil field. 

q significa wawa
The correct term is Wawa ( is name and trademark ).  Is the name of a chain of 40 convenience stores; medium-sized
and with hours extended 24/) in the United States.  They have approximately about 575 stores distributed in almost all
the States of the Union.  They provide fresh food prepared to order.  In quechua language means baby, baby, child, girl,
creature, son, daughter.  GuaGua.

qanodiano
It is more appropriate to use the term Qanondiano.  It means relative to Q'Anon .  He supports Q'Anon's ideas.  Q'Anon,
or better yet Q'Anon Shaman, also known as Q Shaman or Yellowstone Wolf (the Yellowstone wolf or the yellow stone
wolf).  He is one of the assailants of the White House.  His real name is Jacob Anthony Angeli Chansley.  He is an
American far-right activist and conspiracy theorist. 

qap
In radio signals means we are attentive to a new call.  We're on hold.  It stands for "Quiet At Phrequency", which you
can translate Waiting on Frequency or Standby Frequency.  In Colombia it was the name of a TV newscast. 

qe significa decimoctavo
It means that it is ranked 18 in a classification.  Some are also used to say that a 18th part of something is ( a unit
divided into 18 parts equal ).  Each of the 18 Parties that divided a unit 1/18; 40 41.  Ordinal number of the 18 post.

qenan
He is a biblical character who lived before the Universal Flood.  It appears in the book of Genesis.  He is also listed as
Keinán or Cainán.  He was set's grandson, therefore the great-grandson of Adam and Eve.  The father of Qenan or
Keinán, was Enós. 

qenán
Name of a great-grandson of Adam and Eve, Grandson of Set .  It was also named Keinán.  He was a biblical character
who lived before the Universal Flood.  It appears in the book of Genesis.  It also appears as Cainan.  Keinan's father
was Enos.

qi
In traditional Chinese it means vitality, energy strength.  It is a term used in Taoism, traditional Chinese Medicine and in
several Far Eastern countries.  Name of a king of ancient China. 

qom
In quechua language it means childless infertile sterile.

qq es piltrafa
It is synonymous with waste, garbage, waste, scrap.



quaker
It is the name of a registered trademark, world-renowned.  Quaker (Quaker or Quaker) means friend and also tremor, in
the English language.  Name given to a member of a dissident Christian religious community, created by George Fox, in
England and which was called The Religious Society of Friends or Church of Friends. 

quarter
It is an English word that can mean fourth part, barracks, Quadrant or referencing a 25 cent dollar coin.

quarterfinal
It is an English word which means quarter-finals.  It is the stage in which eight teams or players are, therefore there are
four clashes, to determine four semi-finalists.  It's a knockout and prior to the semifinal stage.

quauhcamotli
It is one of the names given in indigenous language (Nahutl, Tarasco ) given in Mexico to Yuca.  It is also known as
aipim, cassava, guacamota, casabe or casava , lumu.  Its scientific name is Manihot sculenta and belongs to the family
Euphorbiaceae.

que agüevado
In Colombia the term aguevado ( or ahuevado ) It is a vulgar way to say fearful, fearful, terrified, afraid, empavorecido,
cringing, cowardly, cowardly, collón, hen.

que ahuevada
The term egg or aguevada is a vulgar way of saying that the person is exorcised, felt dread, which panicked, afraid that.
That is shaped egg, ovovada.

que ahuevada
The term egg or aguevada is a vulgar way of saying that the person is exorcised, felt dread, which panicked, afraid that.
That is shaped egg, ovovada.

que aletazo
Colombia uses more popularly " to beat of wing " some people say " that wing-beat ". They want to signify the smelly
armpits due to perspiration. Also we say chucha.

que asco
An expression that denotes repulsion or rejection of something.  Expression of displeasure or rejection of a bad smell or
something of very bad appearance.  Fetid, disgusting, smelly.  Gas, fuchi , fo .

que asignifica jevo
In Colombia is a synonym of old. It is a Barcelona of Longevo, so gevo should be with g, but everyone writes it with j and
is accepted as well.

que bacan
bacan is incorrectly written and should be written like that cool! being its meaning: the correct term is that cool.  It is used
in Colombia.  Want to say that good people, good person, good-natured, collaborator, supportive, attentive, kind.



que bronca
In several countries of Latin America " that anger " means that you rage. that disgust. In Colombia, it means fight, get,
altercation, rina.

que come el pez xareo
The xareo fish eats small fish, shrimp and crabs.  It's a very voracious fish.

que es absorto
You mean Tootles, stunned, stupefied.  It can also mean stunned, abstracted, marveled, pensive, absorbed.

que es aguarrás
It is another name that we in Colombia to turpentine, which is a natural solvent obtained from the resin of pine and
spruce.

que es aguasapo
Aguasapo or Toad Water, is the name of a refreshing beverage own Costa Rica, has water, ginger, lemon and sugar.

que es aldeano
Who inhabits or comes from a village.  It means villager, paleto, peasant, local.  It is also used to mean rough, rustic,
ordinary, ignorant, rough, patan. 

que es animal
Kingdom of nature that includes all being alive which is characterized by movement, sexual reproduction and embryonic
development. ANIMAL: An acronym for " Harassed our Indians died fighting ".

que es astucia
It refers to doing things well thought, well analyzed. Insight, shrewdness, craftiness, ability, intelligence. Ruse,
stratagem, treta, marrulleria, ruse, mana.

que es bagallo
It is used in Chile.  You want to say problematic person without attributes.  Problem, mess.  It is also the name given to
the Bale, bag, sack, package or bulk hiding things product of a robbery.  Loot.  In Uruguay it means smuggling, goods of
dubious origin.

que es baute
In Colombia it is a surname.  It is of Spanish origin (from the Canary Islands), but with ancestral roots in France.  It also
exists in Venezuela.  Last name of a Venezuelan singer and presenter, known as Carlos Baute.  Its full name is Carlos
Roberto Baute Jiménez .  Second surname of a Valduparense writer and journalist named Alonso Sánchez Baute .

que es bombaceo
The term bombaceo or bombacaceo, means that you have the fruits covered with a wool, cotton, fibres or pulp.  They
are terms synonymous and used in Botany.  They are from the family Malvaceae (formerly Bombaceae).

que es bursopatia



In Medicine it is the condition of a patient suffering from an inflammation of the bursa or synovial sac, which is a
sac-shaped structure that acts as a pad between the soft parts of the joints (muscles, tendons and skin) and the hardest
parts, the bony ones.  Bursitis. 

que es causar estado
The legal encyclopedia is the expression that refers to the permanent character which are the legal effects of an
administrative or judicial decision as a result of having been firm, or what is the same, have passed on authority of res
judicata. Compulsory met or run.

que es chacra
It is the same as farm, estate, farm, conuco.

que es chaponeo
It is the action of cutting or eliminating the stubble, weeds.  Desenrastrojar, weed, desmatonar.  A pasture cleaning.

que es chenco
In Central America it means renco, lame, patojo, crooked. 

que es chingo
It has different meanings in different countries: in Venezuela is flat, flattened nose. In Colombia it is chato, born or cleft
lip ( I try to derogatory ) in Costa Rica is of low quality, in Mexico, Guatemala and Salvador means so much, pretty and
in Nicaragua it is short.

que es chuchuca
It is a typical dish of southern Colombia and Ecuador.  It is a soup that has cabbages, onions, coriander, corn, celery,
garlic and sometimes milk.  Be prepared with pork.

que es contiguensia
What contiguensia is incorrectly written and should be written as "Contingency." being its meaning:<br>The correct term
is contingency. It means event, circumstance, chance, chance, possibility. In the oil industry, are the plans that are made
to take care of emergencies or accidents. Luck, risk.

que es crepancia
Equality that results when comparing two things among if. Equality. Similarity, accuracy.

que es demagogo
Person who practices demagoguery.  A person who directs or manipulates the thought of a mass.  It takes advantage of
the people's feelings to handle it (manipulate it) and benefit.  A person who seeks to govern through deception,
scavengers or manipulations.  person who pretends to be okay with everyone.

que es disfonico
The correct term is disfonico, with tilde.  It means struggling to speak.  It is synonymous with ronco, which is
hoarseness.  Is not the same as aphonic, which is without speech, that can not speak.



que es el ausolutismo
The correct term is absolutism.  It is a designation of a political regime that preaches that the State is absolute. 
Historical period, ideplogia and form of Government initiated by Luis XIV in France.

que es el mechurrio
In the oil industry mean burner burner, gas, torch, tea.  Flare.  It is an outlet of the gas produced in excess in an oil
installation (well or refinery), which burns for safety.

que es el pauro
You want to tell where the water flows.  Mana, spring, water birth, aljibe.

que es el pingullo
It is one of the common names of a small sweet flute, used in Andean peoples.  It also gets the names pinquillo,
pincullo, pincuyo or pinquilhue .  This name is most widespread south of Colombia, Ecuador, Peru and Bolivia.

que es el tzara huin
In Totonac mythology is the name of a young liked that whistle like a goldfinch and which fell in love with the Princess
Xanath.  God Tajin (or fat God, Tláloc), also fell in love with her and at her rejection, transformed it into the vanilla plant.

que es encresparonse
The correct term is encresparonse.  In Colombia to say bravo, rage, irritated, angry, upset, please malgeniarse.  Also
means shaping Goldilocks, curly, crespones, cachumbos.

que es escueto
In Colombia it means simple, unadorned, strict and clean.  Precise, parco, concise, brief, concise, short, sober, naked.

que es eslabon
Link is each one of the rings that form a chain. Rings or linked rings that form a chain.

que es estupor
It means causing much surprise, surprise or startle.  Stupefaction, loss of full consciousness, loss of the normal, physical
and mental conditions.  Dullness, drowsiness, lightheadedness, lethargy, stupor, insensitivity.  Inability to normally
respond to stimuli.

que es fauna
It is the Group of animals of a region or a specific period. The animals by their degree of adaptation are specialized
groups according to the environment where they live ( 41 ecosystems;.

que es filtrafa
The correct term is piltrafa.  It means waste, waste, waste.  That is relegated and despised by others.

que es galamero
It means eating much, which is not satisfied easily.  Glutton, glutton, comelon, greedy, greedy, greedy, hungry
Gargantua.



que es gediondo
The correct term is jediondo and better still smelly.  Means that it expels evil smell, smelly, foul.  Derived from heder.  In
Colombia Don Jediondo is a well-known comedian whose name is Pedro González.  Also the name of a restaurant
owned by that same humorist.  In the area of influence paisa, the word jediondo or gediondo means very astute and
trickster.  Fucking person, person with which must be treated with care.

que es gestor
Manager is a person who as says Ines, manages. In Colombia to a Manager, also say you broker ( does paperwork,
manages ). It has several synonyms: agent, representative, Manager, administrator, Attorney. For us a Manager is also
who does errands, errands or brings the orders.

que es ginear
What ginear is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Ginear S.A.S." being its meaning:<br>It is the name of a
company of medical services and specialists. It has offices in Facatativa and 40 Cúcuta; Colombia ). They also provide
services Odontologicos.en ever heard this word a person from los Llanos in Colombia meaning that I wanted to share
with women, women, relationships with women. But I have not been listening.

que es guineo
In some parts they call banana to banana (Dominican, Honduras, Puerto Rico and Colombian Atlantic coast), in others
banana is a class or shorter and stockier than the common banana variety, which also say popocho or COP (Colombia
Centre).

que es hipsipila
The correct term is Hypsipyla .  It is the name of a genus of insects in the family Pyralidae, of the lepidoptera.  They're
some kind of moths.  They are known as sweepers or drillers.  They are very harmful to the meliacea species of cedar
and mahogany.   .

que es hospedor
It is host in Portuguese, and also means 40 album; usually photographs 41.

que es hospedor
What hospedor is incorrectly written and should be written as "Host" being its meaning:<br>Very likely they wanted to
tell host. In ecology, this term is used to denote that a certain element or species, usually a tree or a plant, is the most
frequent or natural habitat where is or lives a smaller, it may be an insect or a fungus.

que es iliquido
In Colombia, it means that it lacks liquidity.  It has no money in cash.  It has no credit balance on the bank accounts.  It
is also used to mean that a particular property has not been assessed, not has been able to be quantified its value, that
has not been settled.  Which is in the process of being liquidated or valued.  Bare, wrecked, impoverished.

que es indeferente
The correct term is indifferent. It means person who shows or reflects a positive or negative attitude to any eventuality.
That does not reflect intent or penchant for any of the alternatives or proposals that presented.

que es inopia
You want to say without resources. Ignorance, ignorance, indigence. Poverty, hardship, narrowness, hunger and misery.



que es jodete
What fuck is incorrectly written and should be written as a "Fuck you!" being its meaning:<br>It is an expression of total
disapproval of something. It denotes that it desist from continuing to help someone who does not know what to take
advantage. It is to remove support someone because you need to get out of troubles do not strive.

que es la bronquioectasia
what the bronquioectasia is incorrectly written and should be written as "Bronquiectesia" as
meaning:<br>Bronquioectesia or Bronquiectesia are correct. They are medical terms that referenced a chronic or
Permanent dilation of one or more bronchi that can result from bronchitis or genetic causes ( congenital ).

que es la genitalidad
It is the sexual activity which is only limited to the anatomical or body part and especially to the stimulation of the genital
or reproductive organs. Sex body without taking into account the affective part.

que es la pluriglosia en la diversidad cultural
The pluriglosia in cultural diversity is the feature of being able to speak several languages that exist within the same
territory considered as cultural diversity. In Colombia the pluriglosia in this case, is to be able to speak Spanish, English,
Caló, Bantu ( Kikongo and the kimbundu ) Palenquero and languages ancestral Achagua, Pijao, Tunebo, Arhuaco,
Pwinabe ( There are at least 40 more ). In Bolivia can be speaking Spanish, quechua and mapuche. In Spain it would be
speaking Spanish, Asturian, Catalan, Basque, etc. Side note: for that reason is that in some cases I dare send meanings
of African ancestral languages, I know by my contact with various Colombian ethnic groups in environmental work.

que es liwi
In Spanish it is called BOLAS.  It is a weapon used by Inca lkos consisting of a rope which has three divisions at the end
and each one of them a metal sphere with which they whipped or beaten enemies.

que es ludibrio
Ludibrio is a Latin word meaning toy.  By extension means stiff, motionless, dry, hard, rigid, wasteless, inanimate.  It can
also mean mockery, mockery, scorn, humiliation. 

que es medir
It means taking the dimensions, measure, calculate, evaluate, determine, appreciate, check, compare, weigh, probe,
control, restrain.

que es mendigo
Beggar is the person who practiced begging. A person asking for alms. Beggar, beggar, needy, mendicant, boër,
destitute, miserable, supplicants.

que es microecosistema
Microecosistema, is an ecosystem of small dimensions. An aquarium as a microecosistema can be seen.

que es mofletudo
In Colombia it means cheeks, large or fleshy cheeks.  Fat, chubby, popocho, robust, chubby, obese, pot, plump.

que es novena



It is a set made up of nine elements.  Team of nine players, as is a baseball team, that's why this team of baseball
players is called ninth.  Ninth is also a type of Catholic ritual that is done for nine days (or nights) or also for nine months
(one every month).  It is usually made to a particular saint and with an intention or request.  There is also the Ninth
Christmas or Ninth of Aguinaldos, which is a Colombian tradition, in which the baby Jesus is prayed between December
16 and 24 (the 9 days before birth).  It consists of Prayers for every day, to the Blessed Virgin, to St. Joseph, to the Child
God and in addition to the Joys who are allusive stanzas. 

que es panacea
It means that it serves for everything, that it cures any type of disease.  Remedy for everything or universal cure.  In
Greek mythology it was the name of one of the daughters of Aesculapius or Asclepius, sister of Hygia. 

que es pañolones
Pañolones is the plural of wrap.  A wrap is a garment that women used to cover the head.  It may be by embellishment
or to protect themselves from the cold.  Large scarf, shawl.  Elegant and colorful clothing to cover the head.

que es patatús?
In Colombia it is a word that means sopontium, fading, dizziness, effect of sopor.  Fainting, vahyde, weakness,
discouragement, disorder. 

que es pesebrera
In Colombia, a stall is a covered pen where are saved and take care of the beasts. It is stable. Crib.

que es pocilga
Messy and neglected housing.  Small and dirty site.  House small and uncomfortable.  Garage, block, stable, Manger,
piggery, Razorfen, pigsty or cochiquera

que es preextencion
What preextencion is incorrectly written and should be written as "Preextension." being its meaning:<br>In computer
science are usually the dynamics, keys or divisions that we put to the extensions of temporary files to speed up your
search, or subdivide large documents or several chapters. They are used especially in ecology or environment as a
WFP documents.

que es prieto
Means black, dark, bruno, Jet, Blackthorn.  In Colombia is a surname of Spanish origin.

que es pueril
It means that it has no value or interest.  Little valuable.  Simple, simple, trivial, insignificant, bland, childish, trivial, futile,
frivolous.

que es quena
It is a wind instrument native of the South American Andes.  It is essentially a rod or tube with seven holes and blowing
at one end.  Reed flute.

que es rauda
It means that it is fast, fast, light.



que es regencia
It is the job of the Regent. Exert the function of sending, govern. While a ruler in his position. Temporary Government of
a substitute for a King by its minority of age, disability or its absence. Government, mandate.

que es reprogramar
Back to programming.  You can also modify a schedule that was already established.  Change the order of a program
schedules.

que es reptar
Advance or move from one place to another by dragging as reptiles.

que es reptor
Although it is a word not accepted by the SAR, it is a term of clear concept : it crawls, it crawls, that slides down the
floor.  It's synonymous with reptile.  Reptante.  It can also be an error to say rector (directing, commanding, ordering). 

que es sapientisimoç
The correct term is Ho.  To say that he knows a lot.  It is a superlative of Sage.

que es sargazo
The castilianization of Sargassum, which is the name of a genus of Brown seaweed is very large (macroalgae)
feoficeas.  They belong to the class Phaeophyceae.  They are not plants despite the appearance and belong to the
Kingdom Protista.  They are abundant in the middle of the Atlantic and often affect navigation.

que es sequia
The correct term is drought.  It means lack of moisture, dryness, dry, arid, arid, dry, dry, dry summer.

que es shingles
It is the English name of the disease caused by latent chickenpox virus, also called herpes Zoster or commonly shingles.
 It is a very painful disease and that can affect only over the age of 50 who have had chickenpox in childhood.

que es shis
In Portuguese it is short for Setor de Habitas Individuais Sul .  It is a very exclusive residential sector, of mansions and
embassies in Brasilia, the capital of Brazil.  It is located on the shores of Lake Paranoá.  In Mexico it means leftovers,
crumbs. 

que es sili
It stands for integrated intelligent reading system. They promise a quick reading system, which could be read a
200-page book in 20 minutes, or an average of 10 pages per minute.

que es taimado
Taimado means person who works covertly.  Sly, ladino, towards, Fox, hypocritical, sneaky, cunning.

que es tensidad
It is the same as voltage. Ability to withstand stretching. A body's resistance to stretch and not break.



que es tetracampeon
The correct term is tetrachampion, with tilde .  It means he's won a championship four times.  He has been a four-time
champion (not necessarily consecutive).  It has achieved 4 equal titles and porta 4 stars.

que es tipluda
In Colombia you can have two meanings.  One is that it has the thin, soft or delicate voice.  It can also mean body
molding and with good curves, aguitarrado.  Curvy body, such as a treble.  It seems a tiple or sounding like a tiple.

que es tortol
What wireles is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Wireles" being its meaning:<br>It is the name of a Belgian
23-year football player playing midfielder, his full name is Wireles Lumanza Lembi It currently plays in Norway.

que es trufula
What trufula is incorrectly written and should be written as "Trufula" as meaning:<br>The correct term is trufula or trufula
tree. It means real tree, real tree, natural or live tree. Only real tree in the unreal world of plastic in 3D by 34 computer
animation; Lorax ".

que es turambul
Native to the plateau or depression of Turan, in Mongolia, between the Amur-Darya and Syr-Darya rivers. Mongolian.
Hun. Originally from Turan (Tuvan R.R.. In Turkish it means salt. Also used as a synonym for dazed. Crazy. Orate.
Desjuiciado.

que es tusa
In Colombia we say tusa to the inedible heart of the cob after degreasing.  Also tusa is a disappointment, a
disappointment, disaspect, grief, sadness, nostalgia.  Painful period of lovers after a breakup or separation.  Tapetusa is
squeaky, brandy made of contraband.  In Chile neck or nape of the horse.  

que es un baltri
It means bad experience, a fact that was not pleasant or not want to remember.  Something to forget.  It is a misuse in
Spanish of the speech in English "bad trip".  It is used in the Caribbean.

que es un chirrete
In Colombia and especially the environment paisa is a person of very bad taste, ordinary to speak and who does not
know to dress properly. Quirky, ordinary, rough, vulgar.

que es un macroecosistema
Ecology is a large ecosystem. Supraecosistema. Very complex ecosystem or biodiversity.

que es un microorganismo
It is a very small living organism, to such an extent we need a microscope to see it.

que es un programa de resa
It is the network of food safety, which the Colombian Government established to ensure improved access and food
consumption by families of the Sector of the Social Inclusion and reconciliation program. It is for victims and displaced
people in the armed conflict that is ending.



que es un rompimiento
It may be break or end of a love affair.  Action break or shatter.

que es un tomatodo
It is another name that is known to the turra or pirinola. Put a game where gets to turn the pirinola and according to the
side that is exposed over is the score obtained by the player goes from all to all outlet. It usually has 6 faces.

que es una camionada
It is a very informal measure of capacity. In Colombia refers to the quantity of products that fit in the body of a 40-truck
bulk; it can be grains or fruits in bulk ). It can also be for other things or materials such as paper, metals, etc. In Mexico a
truckload is a reference to the total quota for a bus or a bus ( in Mexico they say trucks ). Capacity, capacity ( referring to
the truck 41.

que es una cita textual
It is the exact text transcript, as found in a document. Quote is the exact copy of a paragraph in a text or document.

que es una etnia
A group of people who have the same race, culture and language.  In Greek means people, nation.

que es una meta
In Colombia we use it as synonymous with objective, purpose, aim, in several sports outfit is goal, goal, Archer, Porter
stripe.  It also means end, term, end, finish, culmination, arrival.  Usually white stripe indicating the final competition site. 
It is used in almost every sporting activity.  Raya.

que es wasi
It is not the Spanish language, but quechua language word. House, building, room, home, home

que es yergue
It is an inflection of stand or stand up.  It means stand up, stand up, rise up, bask is, conceited, boast.

que es zangarria
It means giving many laps when he dances.  It spins and jumps like crazy.  Zangarria is also a way to call a jumper and
big spin.

que exigian los estudiantes del68
Among other things: remove the consumer society, controlling the rural exodus, end the war, improvement in wages and
reduction in unemployment especially for the young people who were the most affected in all aspects.

que maricada
In the language colloquial Colombian means triviality, rubbish, pendejada insignificant thing, of little value or
unimportant.  Little significant activity that takes place with displeasure or reluctantly.

que reformulacion
that reformulation is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Reformulation" being its meaning:<br>It is the action



performed by a physician change the dosage of a drug according to the evolution of the patient. The term reformulation
for the change of formula or dosage for an agrochemical or a pesticide application is also valid.

que se cocobolo en panamá
In Panama it is called cocobolo to a fine and hard wooden tree.  Elsewhere it is known as caviuna, cocobolo prieto,
funeram, granadillo, námbar, namba, rosewood, black stick, urauna.  In Nicaragua they call it palosanto.  It belongs to
the fabaceae family and its scientific name is Dalbergia retusa .

que se el pingullo
In several Andean countries, it is a small knotless bamboo flute, used by the indigenous people of southern Colombia,
Ecuador, Peru and Bolivia.

que se ignifica chopin
Chopin is the surname of a great Polish musician whose full name is Federico Francisco Chopín.  Federico Chopin was
married to George Sand, the baroness of Dudevant.

que se ignifica disernir
The correct term is to discern.  Then differentiate, differentiate, judge, qualify, choosing, appreciate, recognize, rating,
reward.

que se ignifica la palabra satanizados
It is an inflection of demonizing.  It means converting or qualify anything demonic or evil without actually being one.  To
believe that something that happens is generated by the devil.

que se ignofica pelle
Pelle means bad, it does not meet the necessary specifications, harmful, harmful, harmful, dangerous, nefarious.

que se ingnifica troja en mexico
A troja is a supporting, an interlocking built by pickets or Palisades of wood and reeds, used to protect some food items.
Its purpose is to keep the plant upright and avoid the fruits to touch the floor, so that fruit can hang, and make more
effective growth. This fence is used in Colombia and Venezuela. It is widely used for corn and beans. In Mexico is the
place where the harvest of a milpa is carried.

que se inifica harte
It is an inflection of a lot or a lot, that Colombia also says jartar or jartar is.  Means filled with food, saturate it, hastiar is,
fill, stuffing is, colmar, cloying, prevent, saturate, tiring, annoy, disturb. In Colombia a lot, or jartar, also means drinking
too much to fall out of the jinchera ( drunkenness, scratch or pea ).

que se nigficas holis
I think they're trying to ask for Holis.  If so, it's plural of holly or holi.  Holi, Holly or Holis is a common way of calling in
Colombia to the Pyracantha coccinea shrub of the family Rosaceae.  It is also known as Mortiño.  Its fruits are edible for
birds.

que se significa dignisimo
It means worthy is incorrectly written and should be written as "40 worthy; should be 41 tilde;" being its meaning:<br>It is



a superlative of worth. Very worthy. It is a form of highly respectful treatment towards a high prelate or a high 40
representative; An Archbishop, a Bishop, the Pope, a cardinal or a President 41. It is the same as excellence or his
Excellency.

que se significa tahua en el diccionario de quechua
that meant tahua on the quechua dictionary is incorrectly written and should be written as "40 Tahua; pronounced tawa
)" being its meaning:<br>Means four, almost always refers to the four cardinal points.

que se unifica cobacha
that unifying garden5 is incorrectly written, and should be written as "Covacha" being its meaning:<br>The correct word
is Covacha. It is a derogatory way of designating a cave. In Colombia we say covacha to a house built with waste and
poor quality materials. Very dirty and disorderly house. Tugurial, shack.

que seinifica temerario
Daredevil has many synonyms: brave, bold, bold, risky, daring, bold, released, unfounded, precipitated, attacked,
endeavoured, thoughtless, careless, inconsiderate.  It means that you don't feel fear, does not feel fear, which is not a
coward.

que sicnifica acaudillada
Acaudillada means championed, directed, commanded, led, led, instructed, guided, driven.

que sicnifica coro
It is the name of a Venezuelan city, capital of the State of Miranda.  In music, vocal group.  Coral.  A group of people
who speak or sing in unison.

que significa !voy pal brete¡
" I'm going palbrete " You can have several meanings. The first is to say that it is in free-fall, stumble on stumble,
bankrupt ( most vulgar form it says go ass tight pal ). It can also mean being for corral, who stopped going to jail and
also said " voy pal coso " or " voy pal pot " Finally it may mean that it will submit to the derision and the juuzgamiento of
others, it is almost like saying " voy pal hell ". Brete in Colombia is a small pen or passage where is passed the livestock
to bathe it, get it, mark it or just to ship it.

que significa &#34;buhardilla&#34;
It is a room that is not used very often, room reservation.  Space that is located in the upper part of a House, the sloping
roof and serving room.   roof window protruding vertically on a roof.  Loft, mezzanine, tabuco, mezzanine, sobrado,

que significa anades
It means ducks.  It can also mean pisingos.  Waterfowl.  Birds belonging to the genus Anas .  Birds belonging to the
family Anatidae .

que significa antropogonicos
What antropogonicos is incorrectly written and should be written as "Antropogónicos" as meaning:<br>It is the series of
myths, stories and legends which deal with the origins of man as a species. In some cases they intermingle with the
different religious trends.



que significa apacible
Inspired by peace.  It means calm, quiet, sweet, placid, pleasant, docile, gentle, benevolent.

que significa apenas tocaban el suelo
People who feel superior to others.  People with greater pretensions than they really are, Vanidosos, believed, cocky. 
That it levitaban.  Oligarchs, aristocrats, bourgeois.

que significa asno silvestre
Wild ass is the definition of hemion or onagro.  It is a class of equine similar to the domestic ass that exists in the
steppes of Asia, but has a larger head, is larger and is a little more robust.

que significa avizoraba en el texto
He looked forward, is an inflection of foresee.  It means watch, glimpse, glimpse, see, watch, observe, notice, glimpse,
discover.

que significa barzal
In Colombia and especially in the Eastern Plains, it means thicket, stubble, weeds, barza, iame rastrojero.  Neglected
land and uncultivated, mount.  In Villavicencio, Colombia, is the name of a neighborhood.

que significa behemot
Behemoth, behemoth, bahanuth, or begimo, is the name of a beast or monster that is described in the book of Job, in
the Holy Bible.  By extension be big and powerful, very strong.  It can be associated with a hippopotamus or a rhino.

que significa bolivones
It is a rude and disrespectful way to treat Bolivians. Is used mostly by residents of the Southern Cone of South America (
Chile and Argentina ).

que significa bufeos
It is the plural of bufeo.  Colombia is one of the common forms of calling a tonina, bofo, pink dolphin or freshwater
dolphin.  Its scientific name is Inia geoffrensis and belongs to the Iniidae family.

que significa caer enfermo
Be a victim of some sort of medical condition that makes you stay home. Disabled, sick, suffering from any medical
condition that prevents him from working.

que significa cansina
It is the feminine of Cansino. It means slow, shuffling, carefree. It also means tired, boring, fastidiada, annoying, weak.

que significa cedral
Cedral is the name given to a forest which has cedar trees.  In Colombia there is wide variety of cedar trees including
Cedar Walnut ( Juglans neotropica ) , 40 pink Cedar; Cedrella montana ) and 40 Yellow Cedar; Pseudosamanea
guachapele ).  They are very fine wood trees.

que significa chapeta



Chapeta in Colombia means that it has the red cheeks, blushing. It also means that it is a woman who is alicorada,
drunk, drunk, alcoholic. It is the feminine of Chapeto.

que significa cheo
CHEO is the acronym in English of Children '' s Hospital of Eastern Ontario ( Ontario 41 East Pediatric Hospital; CHEO
is a familial form of call people called Josef or Joselo. They also tell them Cheito.

que significa chirisiqui
It means naked child in quechua.   " Chiri " It is cold and " siqui " It's buttock, tail, tail gluto, poto. Colloquially in Colombia
we say, I'm as the tail of the baby Jesus or chirisiqui, to denote that we are without money, we also say I'm not a rucano.
Bare.

que significa chispudo
In Colombia it means that it has a spark, that it has a good mood.  That it has grace and joy.  That amuses.  He makes
you laugh with his stories.  jokes and jokes.  Witty, prankster, funny, comical, funny, funny. 

que significa cigua
The chat, also known as the Cigua Palmera is a very common suboscine bird in the Dominican Republic and Haiti. It is
the only species of the family Dulidae, its scientific name is Dulus dominicus. It is endemic to the island of Hispaniola...

que significa cigua
The chat, also known as the Cigua Palmera is a very common suboscine bird in the Dominican Republic and Haiti. It is
the only species of the family Dulidae, its scientific name is Dulus dominicus. It is endemic to the island of Hispaniola...

que significa consaangrante
What consaangrante is incorrectly written and should be written as "Consagrante" as meaning:<br>The correct term is
consagrante. Person making the consecration, priest who celebrated the mass. Person performing an activity with
utmost dedication, efficiency and enthusiasm ( consecrated ).

que significa conurbacion
Conurbation is the process of integral development of a city region. This occurs because the growth accelerated from
large cities that are absorbing villages and hamlets near, to form a large metropolis within a short time. An example is
clear Bogota, because long ago it had to append to Fontibón, Engativá, Usme, Usaquén, Suba and Bosa. Today is
devoted to append to Chia, Cota, Funza, Mosquera and Sopo. These nearby municipalities must agree on a
development that will facilitate the annexation in the shortest possible time. The process of conurbation is the
coordinated urban development of a large city and its nearby municipalities. These urban developments of all is what is
called conurbation.

que significa cunbiyi
Corresponds to a code from models and spare parts in the Nissan brand cars.

que significa dehesa
Field dedicated to the agrosilvopastoril activity.  Field dedicated to forestry, agricultural and livestock activities in a
holistic manner.  Field, era, grassland, meadow, mountain, coto.


